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Board Meetings

The next three

Board meetings will

be held at

7:00 P.M. on

Apr. 10th
May 8th
Jun. 12th

at
The Clubhouse

23372 Niguel Rd.

Pool Area Wi-Fi
As part of the on-going upgrades per-
formed at the pool area, the association
has added Wi-Fi for our residents. We are
hopeful that this service will allow you to
spend more time at the pool even if you
have to work. The access code for the

service is: cvhapool

Community Garage Sale
Start cleaning out your closets and garage
because Terri Bruno will be hosting the
21st Annual Neighborhood Garage Sale
coming this June. Watch for Terri’s no-
tices and signs so you can be a part of this
fun event! Terri Bruno; terri-
bruno@cox.net (949) 500-6556

Check Your Water Bill
Due to recent changes in the way the
MNWD bills for water, the association
experienced a large increase in the water
billing. This was due to MNWD having
underestimated the actual area that was
being watered, causing us to appear to be
using water excessively. That problem
was corrected and the billing is now in-
line. We would like to suggest that you
also have your water billing checked and
make sure they have properly allotted for
the size of your lot that is being watered.
This could save you money!

Key Fobs
As part of the new renovations at the
clubhouse parking lot, you will be able to
access the new gate system by use of your
existing pool key fob. In order to accom-
modate our residents, the Board has ap-
proved the issuance of a 2nd key fob to
residents. The cost for the 2nd key fob
will be $50.00. Please note that only two
fobs will be issued per household. If you
would like to purchase a 2nd fob, please
call our management and they will assist
you.

Architectural Changes
Please remember that you may not make
ANY change to the exterior of your home
without first obtaining written authoriza-
tion from the association. If you want to
make a change, you must submit an archi-
tectural variance request form to the man-
agement office. The request will then be
submitted to the Architectural Committee
for review. If approved, you may then
proceed with your project. Please note
that this process can take up to 30 days.
Your cooperation in this matter is greatly
appreciated. THE BOARD HAS
ADOPTED A NEW RULE THAT WILL
MANDATE THE ASSESSMENT OF A FINE
IN THE AMOUNT OF $250.00 TO
OWNERS THAT PERFORM UNAU-
THORIZED CHANGES TO THEIR HOME.
ALSO, A CEASE AND DESIST LETTER
WILL BE SENT FOR ALL UNAUTHOIR-
ZED CHANGES AND YOU WILL BE
ASKED TO APPLY FOR APPROVAL. FAIL-
URE TO COMPLY WITH THE CEASE
AND DESIST DEMAND AND NOT SUB-
MITTING AN APPLICATION WILL RE-
SULT IN THE FINE ASSESSMENT OF
$100.00 PER DAY UNTIL THE MATTER
IS PROPERLY APPROVED.
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